
HEAT 1
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

1 2 Hi Hand 3.51 Faw ald 1,000
2 4 Coolykereen Jig 3.52 faw Rnon 350
5 6 Calling Shaw 3.72 Slaw Rnon No offer

RESULT: 2,6,4 Distances 5,1 30.16

HEAT 2
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

6 2 Bookies Girls 3.51 Faw Ldnrln 300
9 4 Hi Bluff 3.75 Faw Rnon No offer
8 6 Dodgy Box 3.5 Faw Dspld No offer

RESULT: 2,6,4 Distances 00.5,,7l TIME: 30.4

HEAT 3
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

10 2 Coolykereen Hawk 3.63 Ld2 Styd 1000 No sale
11 4 Togher Girl 3.44 Faw Blk1 550
12 6 Lawless Robin 3.47 Evaw Blk 1 100

RESULT: 2,4,6 Distances 4,5 TIME: 29.7

HEAT 4
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

13 2 Motor Home 3.63 Qaw Ald 400
15 4 Sparta Rumble 3.55 Evaw Styd 450
14 6 Bookies Lass  (W) 3.54 Qaw Bmp 1 450

RESULT: 2,4,6 Distances 1,4 TIME: 29.98

HEAT 5
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

17 2 Beyonce Lady 3.53 Faw Ald 1050
18 4 Balance On Time  4.07 Stbtp 200 No  Sale
19 6 Geneva Charm 3.62 Evaw Fd No offer

RESULT: 2,6,4 Distances 14,6 TIME: 29.54

HEAT 6
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

20 2 Murdaniel Ellie 3.54 Evaw Rnon No offer
21 4 Calling Maeve 3.43 Faw Ald 500 No Sale
22 6 Sparta Trump 3.49 Qaw Fd No sale

RESULT: 4,2,6 Distances 10,8 TIME: 29.58

HEAT 7
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

24 2 Diamond Crash 3.52 600
25 4 Newline Vicky 3.64 500
26 6 Jolly Maid 3.59 400 No sale

RESULT: 2,4,6 Distances 3,4 TIME: 29.57
HEAT 8
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N



27 2 Castlelyons Kaka 3.45 Faw Rnon 650
29 4 Antos Delight 3.5 Ldb2 Styd 300 No sale
30 6 Calling Mame 3.53 Evaw Rnon No offer

RESULT: 4,2,6 Distances 3,4 TIME: 29.7
HEAT 9
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

31 2 Grayslands Tina 3.51 Faw Ald 600
32 4 Game Ciara 3.53 EP Fd No Bid
33 6 Snowy Breeze 3.65 Slaw Rnon No Bid

RESULT: 2,6,4 Distances 12,1 TIME: 29.45
HEAT 10
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

34 2 Rockybay Ace 3.48 Faw  Styd 800 No Sale
35 4 Castlelyons Soni 3.53 Evaw Rnon 100
36 6 Sparta Pepsi 3.65 Faw Fd 400

RESULT: 2,6,4 Distances 5,2 TIME: 29.39

HEAT 11
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

38 2 Tictac Jet 3.49 Faw Ald 1200
39 4 Grayslands Bold 3.52 Evaw Rnon 300 No sale
37 6 Aghaburren Perry 3.55 Evaw Fd Not put up

RESULT: 2,4,6 Distances 4,5 TIME: 29.38

HEAT 12
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

40 Ballyverry Rock 3.45 Faw Ald 700
41 Wallstreet Lady 3.51 Evaw Stydon 400
42 Sleek Gem 3.35 Evaw  Rnon 100 No sale

RESULT: 2,4,6 Distances 1.5,2 TIME: 29.85
HEAT 13
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

43 Foresight 3.46 Faw Ald 500
44 Butterbridge Rum 3.51 Evaw elrun Not put up
45 Malden Louis 3.61 Slaw Rnon 150

RESULT: 2,4,6 Distances 3,2 TIME: 29.73
HEAT 14
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

46 2 Tictac Trouble 3.5 Qaw Blk1 No offer
47 4 Fleet Officer 3.51 Ld2 Stydon
48 6 Sherba 3.48 Faw Ck Not put up

RESULT: 4,2,6 Distances 3,2 TIME: 29.73
HEAT 15
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

50 2 Turbine Town 3.64 Slaw Nvshwd 300
51 4 Golden Impact 3.44 Faw Ald 750



52 6 Lochbo smiley 3.53 Evaw Rnon 1300
RESULT: 4,6,2 Distances 2,6 TIME: 29.22
HEAT 16
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

56 2 Liberal Point 3.49 Evaw Bmp 100
57 4 Cissies Orna 3.42 Faw Ald 1500
58 6 Turbine Tommy 3.47 Evaw Bmp No offer

RESULT: 4,2,6 Distances 14,2 TIME: 29.21

HEAT 17
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

59 2 Malden Ash 3.44 Faw Ald 1000 No sale
60 4 Triple Class 3.54 Evaw Blk1 200
61 6 Liberal Julie 3.47 Qaw Blk1 400

RESULT: 2,6,4 Distances 14,2 TIME: 28.93

HEAT 18
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

62 2 AreYoutheOne 3.51 Qaw Fd No bid
63 4 Talavara Gift 3.49 Qaw Fd No bid
64 6 Jakes Pride 3.57 EPRn Finwell 600

RESULT: 6,2,4 Distances 11,7 29.06
HEAT 19
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

65 2 Gortnagrage  Jel 3.41 Not put up
67 4 Thirsty Work 3.64 750
68 6 Bunnys Decko 3.54 No bid

RESULT: 4,6,2 Distance Dis TIME: 29.52
HEAT 20
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

70 2 Black Hammy 3.44 Ld2 Evch 100 No sale
72 4 Jeddies Light 3.41 Faw Ldnrlne

RESULT: 4,2 Distances 1 TIME: 29.71
HEAT 21
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

55 4 Lads Jess Faw Ald No bid
66 6 Staff Rules Evaw NvShwd 100

RESULT: 4,6 Distances 12 TIME: 18.09
22

LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

RESULT: Dist TIME:



HEAT 23
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

RESULT: Dist TIME:

HEAT 24
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

RESULT: Dist TIME:






